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TAKING shape . . . Maidstone United’s new stadium is well under way and on course to be ready for 
the start of next season. This picture, taken on Sunday by club photographer Steve Terrell, shows the 
view from what will be the 330-seat main stand. 

The grey stone is the base drainage area for the playing area, which will be the league’s first artificial 

3G surface. 

The stadium will be a short walk from the town centre and is being built on land previously owned by 
the Ministry of Defence, which was used in the main by 36 Royal Engineers who are based in 
Maidstone. 
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ALL THE WEEKEND ACTION 
By Peter Butcher – Ryman League Communications Administrator 

 

Premier 
LEATHERHEAD climbed off the foot of the table 
with a 2-1 victory at Hendon on Sunday, despite 
going into the game without top scorers Greg 
Andrews and Tommy Hutchings. Andrews was 
married on Saturday and Hutchings was 
suspended. 

Hendon were also depleted, including the absence 
of their leading marksmen Greg Ngoyi and Jamie 
Busby, but went ahead when Elliott Charles 
converted a sixth-minute penalty. 

Kev Terry replied with a dipping volley in the 27th 
minute and skipper Mark Simmons put Tanners in 
front with a deflected shot seven minutes later. 

Hendon dominated the second half but rarely 
troubled Chico Ramos in the visiting goal. They 
came closest through two of their substitutes as the 
game went into added time. 

James Fisher had a shot cleared off the line by 
Chris Boulter and, a minute or so later, Belal Aite-
Ouakrim shot inches wide. But Leatherhead held 
out and move up two places, above East Thurrock 
and new bottom club Horsham. 

Struggling Aveley, who parted company with 
manager Carl Griffiths during the week, came close 
to an unexpected victory on Saturday. 

Ricky Manderson put Millers ahead from long range 
after 14 minutes, Sean Bonnett-Johnson added 
another ten minutes after the break and they looked 
well on their way to three points, surviving under 
heavy pressure until Sam Long pulled one back 
with 11 minutes to go. 

Mark Willy then struck in the last minute to make it a 
2-2 draw, still a disappointing result for Cray who 
stay seventh in the table when a win would have 
lifted them to fourth. Aveley, who had experienced 
manager Lee Patterson in charge as a caretaker, 
remain 18

th
. 

Leon Smith hit his 11
th
 league goal of the season, 

the best in the Premier, to set Wingate on their way 
to a 3-1 home win over Concord in the division’s 
only other Saturday fixture. 

Smith and Ahmet Rifat put Wingate 2-0 up in 11 
minutes, setting up goals for each other. Tony 
Stokes replied in the 25

th
 minute but Rifat struck 

again midway through the second half to clinch 
victory. Wingate moved to within two points of the 
play-off places while Concord remain in the 
relegation zone. 

Two Premier clubs without a league fixture played 
their third-round tie in the Alan Boon Cup, and 
Hastings gave new player-manager Sean Ray a 
perfect start with a 2-1 home win over Tooting to 
reach the last 16. 

Kenny Pogue scored in the fifth minute and also hit 
the winner in the 72

nd
 minute, Andre McCollin 

having replied for the Terrors late in the first half. 

 

North 
TWO more goals for Needham Market’s Sam 
Newson saw off Ryman North’s bottom club Ilford at 
Cricklefield on Saturday. 

Newson gave Needham the lead on the stroke of 
half-time. Clydie Roberts thumped home an 
equaliser soon after the break in a style that would 
have delighted his cousin Jermain Defoe, but it was 
all in vain for the Foxes as Newson struck again in 
the 68

th
 minute and it finished 2-1 to the visitors. 

It was his 15
th

 league goal of the season and 
restored his clear lead in the Golden Boot race; 
Bognor’s Jason Prior had earlier caught up with him 
by completing a hat-trick. Newson’s tally of 23 in 
league and cup puts him five ahead of Maidstone’s 
Shaun Welford. 

Two of the division’s surprise packets met at 
Tilbury, where nine-man Waltham Forest came from 
3-1 down to earn a 3-3 draw. 

Josh Bonnett fired Forest into the lead after three 
minutes and Alex Read squared it after 20. Forest’s 
real problems began in the 35

th
 minute when 

skipper Gaz Dauti was dismissed for handling a 
goalbound shot and Sam West converted the 
penalty. Harry Cook added a third before the 
interval. 

Joel Palmer reduced the arrears shortly after the 
restart but a red card for Andras Molnar in the 52

nd
 

minute seemed to have ended Forest’s hopes. They 
refused to give up, though, and Manu Dagher hit 
their point-saver five minutes from time. Indeed, 
they came close to a winner. 

Tilbury dropped from third to fifth, overtaken by both 
Leiston and Enfield Town. Leiston won 2-0 at 
Chatham with a fifth-minute goal by Danny Heath 
and one on the hour by Danny Smy. 

Enfield had to come from behind to beat 21
st
-placed 

Ware, for whom Danny Johnson struck after ten 
minutes. It was almost half-time when Adam 
Wallace replied and there were just three minutes 
left when Liam Hope settled it. 

Kieran Ogunkoya, newly signed from Aveley, gave 
Brentwood a 16

th
-minute lead at home to Sudbury 

but they slipped to a 2-1 defeat and dropped out of 
the play-off spots. Dave Wareham levelled matters 
in the 42

nd
 minute and James Baker headed the 

winner 13 minutes into the second half. 

Romford took all three points at home to Heybridge 
Swifts with two unanswered goals. Abs Seymour 
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put them ahead in the 65
th

 minute and Addian 
Clifton made sure with a header 12 minutes later. 

It was no surprise that Soham’s home game against 
Cheshunt finished 1-1. It was the seventh draw of 
the season for both sides, more than any other 
team in the league. Matt Robinson scored for the 
hosts after 25 minutes and Josh Hutchinson 
responded with a penalty 12 minutes later. Soham 
later had Tom Libatore sent off. 

South 
THE top three in Ryman South continued their 
impressive form with a hat-trick of victories on 
Saturday. 

Dulwich remain a point clear after extending the 
league’s only 100 per cent home record to seven 
games, recovering from the shock of an early 
Williams Adou goal to beat Walton Casuals 3-1. 

Adou’s fourth-minute goal held up for almost half an 
hour before Sanchez Ming made it 1-1, and it was 
the 70

th
 minute before Junior Kadi’s penalty put 

Hamlet ahead. Frankie Sawyer added his 11
th

 
league goal. 

Shaun Welford took his goal tally to 18 in all 
competitions with a double in Maidstone’s 3-1 win at 
Eastbourne Town. Michael Phillips gave Stones a 
sixth-minute lead and, although Sonny Cobbs 
levelled it on the half-hour, Welford – who had 
earlier hit the bar – restored the advantage before 
half-time. Always on top, Stones did not make sure 
of the win until Welfiord scored again in added time. 

Bognor’s Jason Prior, meanwhile, took his total to 
17, 14 of them in the league, with a 19-minute hat-
trick starting on the half-hour as Rocks swamped 
visiting Burgess Hill 5-0. James Crane had already 
given Bognor the lead and Terry Dodd notched the 
fifth. So Bognor remain a point behind Maidstone 
who are in turn a point adrift of the leaders, while 
Hillians drop back into a relegation spot. 

Fourth-placed Folkestone were in FA Trophy action 
and Corinthian-Casuals clung on to the other play-
off spot thanks to a double in the last 12 minutes by 
substitute Steve Barilli which snatched a 2-2 home 
draw with Whyteleafe. Scott Simpson had given 
Whyteleafe the lead after 16 minutes and Jerson 
Dos Santos doubled it 20 minutes after the break. 

That kept Casuals a point ahead of Whitehawk, 3-2 
winners at Merstham. Joe Gatting put Whitehawk 
ahead three minutes before half-time but it was all 
square by the interval and Merstham went ahead 
three minutes after the restart. Fabio Saravia and 
Roscoe Dsane were the home marksmen. Hawks 
would not be denied, however, and Ben Godfrey’s 
57

th
-minute strike was followed by Gatting’s 70

th-

minute decider. 

New Whitstable boss Justin Luchford must be well 
pleased with his charges after they thumped 
Croydon Athletic 4-1 in Kent with caretaker boss 
Dave Fairclough at the helm. James Simmons set 
the ball rolling on 16 minutes and Danny Williams 

made it 2-0 just before the break. Stuart Vahid 
stretched the lead with a 52

nd
-minute penalty and, 

although Peter Afolayan conjured a swift reply, 
there was no way back for the Rams and Williams 
nabbed his second to make sure. 

Walton & Hersham went into their home game 
against Crawley Down with just seven goals to their 
credit, the league’s lowest total, and improved that 
figure substantially by beating the bottom club 4-1. 
Now the only team in the league with a single-figure 
goal tally are East Thurrock, who next Saturday 
face Macclesfield in the first round of the FA Cup! 

Walton were two up at half-time through Daniel 
Morris and Matt Pattison, and it was 4-0 by the sixth 
minute of the second period as Pattison and 
Graeme Purdy hit the target. Luke Blewden 
managed some consolation for the Anvils, who had 
Josh Webb sent off. 

Sittingbourne drew 2-2 with Chipstead at Central 
Park, something of a goal feast for the Brickies who 
had scored only nine goals and conceded 11 in 
their 11 previous league outings. Hicham Akhazzan 
put the hosts in front midway through the first half 
but Marcus Elliott soon replied, netting the rebound 
when Jason Goodchild’s penalty was saved. 
Goodchild had another chance from the spot in the 
66

th
 minute and made no mistake, but Bryan Glover 

rescued the hosts with a free-kick seven minutes 
from time. 

  FA Trophy 
REMARKABLE Redbridge were the stars of the 
show yet again as the Ryman League enjoyed a 
highly-successful Saturday in the second qualifying 
round of the FA Trophy, winning seven of their ten 
match-ups with Southern League opponents. 

The Motormen followed up last week’s FA Cup 
victory over Conference Premier side Ebbsfleet by 
travelling to Southern League leaders Cambridge 
City and coming out on top by the odd goal in three 
after being reduced to ten men; surely a good omen 
for next week when they take on the other half of 
Oxbridge, Oxford City, in the Cup. 

Jamie Haywood put Redbridge ahead five minutes 
after half-time. City were quickly on level terms but 
the Motormen would not be denied, despite losing 
Ben Bradbury to a second yellow card with 20 
minutes left, and Joe Gardner hit an 81

st
-minute 

winner. 

That’s another £3,000 in the Oakside bank and a 
total of £36,200 from their exploits – played eight, 
won eight – in the two FA competitions. Yet they lie 
18

th
 in Ryman North, having taken maximum points 

from only four of their 11 league games. 

Another Ryman North club, Thamesmead, ejected 
Southern Premier opposition by beating visiting 
Arlesey 3-0. Danny Penny opened the scoring 
moments before half-time and he headed another in 
the 66

th
 minute after Brad Killick had doubled the 

lead, also with his head. 
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Two all-Premier games went the way of the Ryman 
clubs. Lowestoft fell behind to a goal from the 
prolific John Frendo at Hitchin but ex-Hitchin striker 
Matt Nolan replied in the 19

th
 minute and the 

Trawlerboys eventually took the lead with a long-
range blockbuster from Scott Mitchell in the 76

th
 

minute. Joe Francis made the final score 3-1 with a 
penalty. 

The score was the same at Carshalton, where 
Cirencester went out despite the boost of a first-
minute goal. Dean Lodge quickly replied with a 
penalty, Laurent Hamici put Robins ahead eight 
minutes into the second half and Paul Vines 
finished it off. 

Lee Townrow headed the late decider as Maldon 
edged out visiting Bedfont 3-2. The Ryman side 
took the lead early in each half, Sos Yao and Leon 
Antoine the scorers, only to be pegged back. 

First-half goals from Rob Swaine and Dave Knight 
ensured that Ryman Premier leaders Billericay 
averted an upset as they beat St Neots 2-0 at New 
Lodge, but they will be disappointed to have had 
Junior Luke sent off eight minutes from time. The 
visitors had been reduced to ten earlier in the half. 

The last of the seven inter-league victories came 
from Folkestone, who beat Daventry 4-2 in Kent. 
Reports of games on November 5 are almost 
obliged to include a reference to the date and, 
having held out until this point, it can be avoided no 
longer. The fireworks at Folkestone came from 
James Everitt, who scored all four goals. 

His first, after 14 minutes, might have been a damp 
squib as the visitors were soon on level terms. But 
he restored the lead on 43 minutes to ward off a 
half-time rocket from the management and his 
sparkler of a game continued with a hat-trick goal 
13 minutes after the restart. Daventry pulled 
another one back but Everitt and his teammates 
were turning catherine wheels of delight when he 
clinched it from the penalty spot in added time. 

Godalming fell foul of a legend at Gosport. Steve 
Claridge made his Football League debut almost 
two years before Alex Ferguson became 
Manchester United’s manager, yet he has recently 
donned his boots again to play for the Southern 
League side and his eighth-minute strike set G’s on 
their way to a 4-0 defeat. 

Anton Agdomar gave Potters Bar a fifth-minute lead 
at Uxbridge but it lasted only two minutes and the 
Ryman North side were eventually beaten 5-2. 
Denis Paratusic’s dismissal on the half-hour was 
the key moment, especially as Uxbridge went 3-1 
up from the resulting free-kick. 

Even so, Mark O’Toole pulled it back to 3-2 in the 
58

th
 minute, pouncing when Tom Pett’s shot hit a 

post, and the final scoreline flattered the hosts. 

The third Southern League side to come out on top 
were Didcot, who scored an unanswered goal in 
each half at Worthing. Rebels played with ten men 

for virtually the whole second half after top scorer 
Ryan McBride was sent off. 

There were five all-Ryman ties and the stars of the 
show were mid-table North division side Harlow, 
who came from 2-0 down to beat visitors Lewes, 
third in the Premier, 3-2. Ian Draycott gave Rooks a 
1-0 half-time lead and scored again a minute after 
the break. 

Harlow, though, had been on top for much of the 
time and they were rewarded with a pair of 
penalties in the 49

th
 and 67

th
 minutes, both 

converted by Danny Brown. Then James Bunn hit 
the winner with ten minutes left. 

The Essex derby between Grays and Canvey 
produced four penalties, all successful, as Canvey 
won 3-2. The first was converted by Harry 
Agombar, after a foul on Joao Carlos, to give the 
Ryman North hosts the lead after 25 minutes. 
Danny Heale replied for Canvey ten minutes later 
with the only goal from open play. Carlos was again 
the victim when Agombar was spot-on for the 
second time after 54 minutes. 

Then it was over to Canvey’s penalty ace Rob King, 
who levelled the scores in the 67

th
 minute, after Rob 

Hill was fouled, and made no mistake again when a 
handling offence gave him the chance to win it with 
two minutes left. 

FA Cup survivors East Thurrock had to fight for their 
4-2 victory at Faversham, for whom Justin Ascheri 
headed the opener after 12 minutes. Kris Newby 
and Petrit Elbi scored three minutes either side of 
half-time to put the Premier side ahead, only for 
Adrian Stone to make it 2-2 in the 55

th
 minute. 

Newby converted a penalty on 75 minutes and 
Colchester loanee Freddy Ladapo, who started the 
season at Maldon, added a late fourth. There was 
still time for Faversham to win a penalty of their 
own, and Tom Stephen was dismissed for the 
offence, but Lee Shearer shot over the bar. 

Bury, too, were given a good run for their money by 
opposition from a lower division. Hythe made the 
long trip into Suffolk and fell behind to a long-range 
Danny Cunningham free-kick on 14 minutes. 

Craig Thompson equalised in the 34
th

 minute but 
Sam Reed quickly restored Bury’s lead and added 
another soon after the interval. Hythe fought back 
again and Thompson claimed his second with 25 
minutes left, but they could do no more. 

There were only two all-Ryman Premier ties and 
both finished 1-1, with replays to come on Tuesday. 

Hornchurch went in front when Elliot Styles scored 
from a 12

th
-minute corner at Harrow, who replied 

with a Quincy Rowe header at the same stage of 
the second half. Gary Jones almost won it for 
Harrow, but his effort came back off the bar. 

Richard Avery put Margate ahead on the stroke of 
half-time but they will have to travel for a replay at 
Wealdstone after Rob Fitzgerald squared it in the 
57

th
 minute. 
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Results 
 

 
Saturday, 5 November, 2011 

Premier 
 

Cray Wanderers 2-2 Aveley 156 
Long 79, Willy 89 Manderson 14, Bonnett-Johnson 55 

Wingate & Finchley 3-1 Concord Rangers 94 
L Smith 6, Rifat 11, 67 Stokes 25 

 

North 
 

Brentwood Town 1-2 AFC Sudbury 155 
Onunkoya 16 Wareham 42, Baker 58 

Chatham Town 0-2 Leiston 105 
 Heath 5, Smy 60 

Enfield Town 2-1 Ware 178 
Wallace 45, Hope 87 Johnson 10 

Ilford 1-2 Needham Market 57 
Roberts 58 Newson 45, 68 

Romford 2-0 Heybridge Swifts 104 
Seymour 65, Clifton 77 

Soham Town Rangers 1-1 Cheshunt 98 
Robinson 26 Hutchinson 37 (pen) 

Tilbury 3-3 Waltham Forest 65 
Read 20, West 35 (pen), Cook 40 Bonnett 3, Palmer 47, Dagher 85 
 

South 
 

Bognor Regis Town 5-0 Burgess Hill Town 464 
Crane 20, Prior 30, 42, 49, Dodd 73 

Corinthian-Casuals 2-2 Whyteleafe 102 
Barilli 78, 83 Simpson 16, Dos Santos 65 

Dulwich Hamlet 3-1 Walton Casuals 276 
Ming 35, Kadi 70 (pen), Sawyer 80 Adou 4 

Eastbourne Town 1-3 Maidstone United 291 
Cobbs 30 Phillips 6, Welford 40, 90+2 

Merstham 2-3 Whitehawk 106 
Saravia 45, Dsane 48 Gatting 42, 70, Godfrey 57 

Sittingbourne 2-2 Chipstead 123 
Akhazzan 23 Elliott 27 
Glover 83 Goodchild 66 (pen) 

Walton & Hersham 4-1 Crawley Down 140 
Morris 14, Pattison 33, 48, Purdy 51 Blewden 67 

Whitstable Town 4-1 Croydon Athletic 155 
Simmons 16, Williams 44, 69, Afolayan 54 
Vahid 52 (pen) 

 

               Alan Boon Cup Third Round 
 

Hastings United 2-1 Tooting & Mitcham United 243 
Pogue 5, 72 McCollin 38 
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 FA Carlsberg Trophy Second Qualifying Round 
Billericay Town 2-0 St Neots Town 315 

Swaine 17, Knight 42 

Bury Town 3-2 Hythe Town 302 
Cunningham 14, S Reed 37, 51 Thompson 34, 65 

Cambridge City 1-2 Redbridge 291 
Gould 59 Haywood 50, Gardner 81 

Carshalton Athletic 3-1 Cirencester Town 225 
Lodge 7 (pen), Hamici 53, Vines 70 Hunt 1 

Folkestone Invicta 4-2 Daventry Town 266 
J Everitt 14, 43, 58, 90+3 (pen) Hendrie 20, O’Grady 73 

Faversham Town 2-4 East Thurrock United 137 
Ascheri 12, Stone 55 Newby 42, 75 (pen), Elbi 48, 
 Ladapo 90 

Gosport Borough 4-0 Godalming Town 170 
Claridge 8, Bennett 15, 24, Wilde 90+1 

Grays Athletic 2-3 Canvey Island 344 
Agombar 25 (pen), 54 (pen) Heale 35, King 67 (pen), 88 (pen) 

Harlow Town 3-2 Lewes 183 
Brown 49 (pen), 67 (pen), Bunn 80 Draycott 26, 46 

Harrow Borough 1-1 AFC Hornchurch 123 
Rowe 56 Styles 12 

Hitchin Town 1-3 Lowestoft Town 282 
Frendo 12 Nolan 19, Mitchell 76, Francis 87 (pen) 

Maldon & Tiptree 3-2 Bedfont Town 58 
Yao 12, Antoine 47, Townrow 83 S Pinnock 35, Nankani 49 

Margate 1-1 Wealdstone 304 
Avery 45 Fitzgerald 57 

Thamesmead Town 3-0 Arlesey Town 32 
Penny 44, 66, Killick 56 

Uxbridge 5-2 Potters Bar Town 124 
Murray 7, 34, Yarnie 25.  Agdomar 5, O’Toole 58 
Warsame 78, Duncan 90 

Worthing 0-2 Didcot Town 263 
 Stanley 24, Seaward 80 

Sunday, 6 November, 2011 
 

Premier 

Hendon 1-2 Leatherhead 202 
Charles 6 (pen) Terry 26, Simmons 34 
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 Home Away 

RYMAN PREMIER P W D L F A W D L F A Pts GD 
Billericay Town 13 5 2 0 23 8 4 1 1 10 5 30 20 
AFC Hornchurch 14 3 1 3 12 6 6 0 1 18 6 28 18 
Lewes 13 6 0 1 11 6 2 2 2 8 9 26 4 
Metropolitan Police 14 4 0 3 10 7 4 1 2 12 6 25 9 
Hendon 13 2 3 2 10 11 5 0 1 10 1 24 8 
Lowestoft Town 12 3 1 1 12 5 4 1 2 15 8 23 14 
Cray Wanderers 13 4 1 1 13 10 3 1 3 15 8 23 10 
Bury Town 13 4 0 2 10 3 3 1 3 12 12 22 7 
Wingate & Finchley 14 4 2 2 15 15 2 2 2 10 9 22 1 
Canvey Island 13 3 0 4 6 8 4 1 1 10 7 22 1 
Wealdstone 14 3 2 2 9 9 2 3 2 11 7 20 4 
Kingstonian 14 3 1 3 12 13 3 1 3 10 14 20 -5 
Harrow Borough 14 1 4 2 7 12 3 1 3 10 9 17 -4 
Carshalton Athletic 13 1 1 4 3 10 4 1 2 8 8 17 -7 
Hastings United 14 2 2 3 8 7 2 2 3 7 12 16 -4 
Tooting & Mitcham United 14 1 2 4 7 15 3 1 3 12 20 15 -16 
Margate 12 1 0 5 5 11 2 3 1 9 8 12 -5 
Aveley 15 0 3 4 6 13 2 3 3 11 14 12 -10 
Concord Rangers 14 0 4 3 9 14 1 2 4 7 14 9 -12 
Leatherhead 12 1 0 4 6 12 1 2 4 6 9 8 -9 
East Thurrock United 11 1 1 4 6 11 1 1 3 3 7 8 -9 
Horsham 13 0 1 6 6 17 2 1 3 9 13 8 -15 
 
RYMAN NORTH P W D L F A W D L F A Pts GD 
Grays Athletic 13 4 1 2 14 7 5 1 0 13 6 29 14 
Needham Market 13 5 0 1 24 5 3 3 1 17 10 27 26 
Leiston 14 5 0 1 15 5 3 2 3 12 11 26 11 
Enfield Town 14 4 2 1 17 10 3 3 1 11 9 26 9 
Tilbury 15 5 2 1 18 12 2 2 3 14 18 25 2 
Brentwood Town 14 2 1 4 8 8 5 1 1 13 3 23 10 
Waltham Forest 11 5 0 2 16 11 2 1 1 8 7 22 6 
Romford 15 4 3 1 15 10 2 1 4 11 13 22 3 
Thamesmead Town 11 2 1 1 9 6 4 2 1 12 7 21 8 
Potters Bar Town 13 5 1 1 16 11 1 2 3 6 18 21 -7 
Harlow Town 13 3 2 1 10 6 3 0 4 9 10 20 3 
Chatham Town 15 4 0 4 11 12 2 1 4 5 8 19 -4 
Waltham Abbey 12 2 1 3 18 14 3 0 3 12 11 16 5 
Soham Town Rangers 15 2 2 4 9 15 1 5 1 14 15 16 -7 
Cheshunt 14 3 2 2 8 15 0 5 2 4 10 16 -13 
Heybridge Swifts 14 1 3 2 6 9 3 0 5 13 13 15 -3 
AFC Sudbury 11 2 2 2 5 6 2 1 2 8 10 15 -3 
Redbridge 11 0 2 3 9 14 4 0 2 10 6 14 -1 
Great Wakering Rovers 14 2 3 2 12 12 1 0 6 5 25 12 -20 
Maldon & Tiptree 10 1 0 4 5 8 1 1 3 6 13 7 -10 
Ware 14 1 2 4 5 9 0 1 6 6 17 6 -15 
Ilford 14 1 2 4 7 10 0 0 7 6 17 5 -14 
 
RYMAN SOUTH P W D L F A W D L F A Pts GD 
Dulwich Hamlet 13 7 0 0 18 3 3 2 1 10 6 32 19 
Maidstone United 13 5 0 1 9 3 5 1 1 15 7 31 14 
Bognor Regis Town 13 4 2 0 17 6 5 1 1 19 6 30 24 
Folkestone Invicta 13 5 2 0 13 4 3 0 3 9 8 26 10 
Corinthian-Casuals 13 4 1 1 15 10 3 1 3 5 8 23 2 
Whitehawk* 12 4 1 0 12 2 4 0 3 13 8 22 15 
Worthing 9 4 1 0 17 5 2 1 1 5 5 20 12 
Godalming Town 10 3 1 1 8 5 3 1 1 10 6 20 7 
Chipstead 12 2 1 3 6 6 3 2 1 13 8 18 5 
Ramsgate 13 3 1 2 6 6 2 2 3 9 12 18 -3 
Hythe Town 13 3 2 2 16 10 2 0 4 5 11 17 0 
Eastbourne Town 14 2 1 4 9 9 2 3 2 10 12 16 -2 
Faversham Town 11 2 2 1 7 5 2 1 3 5 12 15 -5 
Merstham 12 3 1 2 10 11 1 2 3 8 13 15 -6 
Sittingbourne 12 1 4 1 6 5 2 1 3 5 8 14 -2 
Whitstable Town 14 3 0 4 9 9 1 1 5 7 22 13 -15 
Croydon Athletic 13 3 1 3 11 12 0 2 4 5 13 12 -9 
Walton & Hersham 14 2 1 4 9 9 1 1 5 2 8 11 -6 
Walton Casuals 14 2 1 4 11 17 0 3 4 9 16 10 -13 
Whyteleafe 13 1 1 5 6 14 1 2 3 7 9 9 -10 
Burgess Hill Town 13 1 3 3 10 11 1 0 5 5 16 9 -12 
Crawley Down 14 1 0 6 7 20 1 0 6 6 18 6 -25 

*Three points deducted for fielding an ineligible player 

TABLES 
(To Sunday November 6) 
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Forthcoming Fixtures 

 
Tuesday, November 8th 

 

Premier 
Cray Wanderers                                            v.  Canvey Island 
Lowestoft Town                        v.  Horsham 

North 
Brentwood Town            v.  Potters Bar Town 
Leiston v.  AFC Sudbury 
Needham Market v.  Ware 
Thamesmead Town             v.  Maldon & Tiptree 
 

South 
 

Chipstead                 v.  Croydon Athletic 
Corinthian-Casuals        v.  Hythe Town 
Merstham v.  Crawley Down 
Ramsgate                  v.  Folkestone Invicta 
Whitehawk                 v.  Sittingbourne 
Worthing                  v.  Whyteleafe 
 

FA Trophy – 2nd Qualifying Round Replays 

AFC Hornchurch v. Harrow Borough 
Wealdstone v. Margate 
 

Essex Senior Cup – 3rd Round 
Billericay Town v. Colchester United 
Concord Rangers v. Southend Manor 
East Thurrock United  v. Tilbury 
Ilford  v. Grays Athletic 
Southend United v. Waltham Forest 
 

Surrey Senior Cup – 2nd Round 
Horley v. Walton & Hersham 
 

Sussex Senior Cup – 2nd Round 
Hastings United  v. Lancing 
 

Wednesday, November 9th 
 

Premier 

Metropolitan Police       v.  Kingstonian 
 

South 
Maidstone United         v.  Godalming Town 
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Essex Senior Cup – 3rd Round 
Great Wakering Rovers v. Chelmsford City 
 

Thursday, November 10th 
 

Essex Senior Cup – 3rd Round  
Redbridge v. Aveley 
 

Middlesex Senior Cup 1st round 
Enfield Town v. Harefield United  
 

Saturday, November 12th  
 

Premier 
Aveley                    v.  Lowestoft Town 
Billericay Town           v.  Wealdstone 
Concord Rangers           v.  AFC Hornchurch 
Harrow Borough            v.  Leatherhead  
Hastings United           v.  Cray Wanderers 
Hendon                    v.  Canvey Island (KO 1pm) 
Lewes                     v.  Bury Town 
Margate                   v.  Wingate & Finchley 
Tooting & Mitcham United  v.  Horsham 
 

North 
AFC Sudbury               v.  Enfield Town 
Cheshunt                  v.  Ilford 
Heybridge Swifts         v.  Great Wakering Rovers 
Leiston                   v.  Brentwood Town 
Needham Market            v.  Thamesmead Town 
Potters Bar Town          v.  Maldon & Tiptree 
Waltham Abbey             v.  Harlow Town 
Waltham Forest            v.  Romford 
Ware                      v.  Chatham Town 
 

South 
Burgess Hill Town         v.  Eastbourne Town 
Chipstead                 v.  Whitstable Town 
Crawley Down              v.  Corinthian-Casuals 
Croydon Athletic          v.  Walton & Hersham 
Folkestone Invicta        v.  Bognor Regis Town 
Godalming Town            v.  Faversham Town 
Maidstone United          v.  Ramsgate 
Walton Casuals            v.  Merstham 
Whitehawk                 v.  Hythe Town 
Whyteleafe                v.  Sittingbourne 
Worthing                  v.  Dulwich Hamlet 
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FA Cup – 1st Round Proper 
 
 
 

East Thurrock United v. Macclesfield Town 
Redbridge v. Oxford City 
 

Sunday, November 13th 
 

Premier 
Kingstonian               v.  Carshalton Athletic 
 

North 
Grays Athletic            v.  Soham Town Rangers 
 

Monday, November 14th 
 
 

             The Alan Boon Cup – 3rd Round 
Enfield Town  v. AFC Sudbury 
 

Tuesday, November 15th 
 

Premier 

Lowestoft Town            v.  Hendon 
 

North 
Great Wakering Rovers     v.  Potters Bar Town 
Heybridge Swifts          v.  Waltham Forest 
Maldon & Tiptree          v.  Waltham Abbey 
 

South 
Whitehawk                 v.  Burgess Hill Town 
Worthing                  v.  Croydon Athletic 
 
 

                    The Alan Boon Cup – 2nd Round 

 
East Thurrock United  v. Redbridge 
 

                    The Alan Boon Cup – 3rd Round 

 
Bury Town  v. Chatham Town 
Canvey Island  v. Ware 
Corinthian Casuals  v. Eastbourne Town 
Harrow Borough  v. Cheshunt 
Leatherhead  v. Bognor Regis Town 
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Surrey Senior Cup – 2nd Round  
Woking v. Merstham 
 
Wednesday, November 16th 
                     

                The Alan Boon Cup – 3rd Round 
 
Dulwich Hamlet  v. Waltham & Hersham 
Leiston  v. Billericay Town 
Lewes  v. Folkestone Invicta 
Maidstone United  v. Carshalton Athletic 
Metropolitan Police  v. Margate 
Needham Market  v. Brentwood Town 
Ramsgate  v. Chipstead 
 

Surrey Senior Cup – 2nd Round  
Tooting & Mitcham v. AFC Wimbledon 
 

Saturday, November 19th 
 

Premier 

Aveley                    v.  Horsham 
Bury Town                 v.  East Thurrock United 
Carshalton Athletic       v.  Leatherhead 
Concord Rangers          v.  Harrow Borough 
Hastings United           v.  AFC Hornchurch 
Hendon                    v.  Billericay Town 
Lewes                     v.  Wingate & Finchley 
Lowestoft Town            v.  Cray Wanderers 
Margate                   v.  Kingstonian 
Metropolitan Police       v.  Tooting & Mitcham United 
Wealdstone                v.  Canvey Island 
 

North 
Brentwood Town            v.  Great Wakering Rovers 
Chatham Town              v.  Enfield Town 
Cheshunt                  v.  Redbridge 
Grays Athletic            v.  Potters Bar Town 
Harlow Town              v.  Heybridge Swifts 
Soham Town Rangers        v.  Tilbury 
Thamesmead Town           v.  Ilford 
Waltham Abbey             v.  Needham Market 
Waltham Forest            v.  Leiston 
Ware                      v.  AFC Sudbury 
 

South 
Bognor Regis Town         v.  Eastbourne Town 
Chipstead                 v.  Worthing 
Corinthian-Casuals        v.  Sittingbourne 
Croydon Athletic          v.  Whyteleafe 
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Dulwich Hamlet            v.  Ramsgate 
Faversham Town            v.  Burgess Hill Town 
Godalming Town            v.  Whitstable Town 
Hythe Town                v.  Walton & Hersham 
Maidstone United         v.  Merstham 
Walton Casuals            v.  Folkestone Invicta 
Whitehawk                 v.  Crawley Down 
 
 

                  The Alan Boon Cup – 2nd Round 
Maldon & Tiptree          v.  Romford 

 
 

Facts & Figures 
 
Wins Analysis (As at 6

th
 November 2011) 

 
Premier Division  
Matches Played         146 

Home Wins  52 

(35.62 %) 

Away Wins  63 

(43.15 %) 

Draws   31 

(21.23 %) 

Home Goals           206 

Away Goals           223 

Total Goals           429 

Goals per game        2.94 

Division One North  
Matches Played        145 

Home Wins  63 

(43.45 %) 

Away Wins  50 

(34.48 %) 

Draws   32 

(22.07 %) 

Home Goals           257 

Away Goals           215 

Total Goals           443 

Goals per game        3.26 

Division One South  
Matches Played        139 

Home Wins  65 

(46.76 %) 

Away Wins  47 

(33.82%) 

Draws   27 

(19.42%) 

Home Goals           232 

Away Goals           182 

Total Goals           414 

Goals per game         2.98 

 

Four Goal Hero 

James Everitt   Folkestone Invicta 

 

Hat-trick Hero 

Jason Prior   Bognor Regis Town 

 

Best Attendances – Club by Club 

 

Premier 
762 Lowestoft Town v Lewes  20.08.2011 

749 Lewes v Wealdstone  01.10.2011 

626 Wealdstone v Lowestoft Town  08.10.2011 

601 Billericay Town v Canvey Island  29.10.2011 

548 Horsham v Concord Rangers  08.10.2011 

506 Margate v Lowestoft Town  27.08.2011 
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North 
452 Needham Market v AFC Sudbury  29.08.2011 

314 Grays Athletic v Tilbury  05.10.2011 

267 AFC Sudbury v Tilbury  27.08.2011 

260 Chatham Town v Grays Athletic  10.09.2011 

240 Enfield Town v Romford  01.10.2011 

203 Harlow Town v Romford  20.08.2011 

 

South 
589 Bognor Regis Town v Whitehawk  29.08.2011 

437 Maidstone United v Dulwich Hamlet  29.10.2011 

372 Whitstable Town v Maidstone United 23.08.2011 

321 Folkestone Invicta v Whitstable Town 29.08.2011 

312 Worthing v Eastbourne Town  29.10.2011 

289                             Dulwich Hamlet v Hythe Town           11.10.2011 

 

Player Movements  

Players registered to date: 2511 New players registered this week: 50 

Transferred this week: 

PlayerPlayerPlayerPlayer                FromFromFromFrom                ToToToTo    

Donny Barnard  AFC Hornchurch  Harlow Town 

Dale Brightly   Concord Rangers  Billericay 

James Brockhurst  Whyteleafe   Horsham 

Leon Constantine  Lewes    Tooting & Mitcham 

Bradley Duke   Merstham   Walton Casuals 

Stephen Harper  Metropolitan Police  Bognor Regis Town 

Sam Holloway   Concord Rangers  Great Wakering Rovers 

Billy Manners   Sittingbourne   Leatherhead 

Kieran Ogunkoya  Aveley    Brentwood Town 

Ellis Skidmore   Concord Rangers  Great Wakering Rovers 

Gareth Williams  Walton & Hersham  Walton Casuals 

Eljay Worrell   Grays Athletic   Tilbury 

Liam Wright   Horsham   Merstham 
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Leading Goal Scorers - League Goals Only (as at 6th November  2011) 

 

Premier 
Leon Smith Wingate & Finchley 11 

Martin Tuohy AFC Hornchurch 10 

Richard Jolly Wealdstone 10 

Jack Clark Cray Wanderers 8 

Lubomir Guentchev Lowestoft Town 7 

Michael Malcolm Lewes 7 

Jon-Jo Bates Harrow Borough 7 

Jay May Billericay Town 7 

Lewis Smith AFC Hornchurch 6 

Leigh Bremner Cray Wanderers 6 

Staforde Palmer Metropolitan Police 6 

Rob King Canvey Island 6 

David Knight Billericay Town 6 

 

North 
Sam Newson Needham Market 15 

Jack West Tilbury 9 

Nathan Dewberry Great Wakerinng Rovers 7 

Tom Pett Potters Bar Town 7 

Steve Cawley Waltham Abbey 7 

Adam Wallace Enfield Town 7 

Joe Sweeney Grays Athletic 6 

Tim Shaw Waltham Abbey 6 

Dave Cobb Soham Town Rangers 6 

Danny Thrower Needham Market 6 

Josh Hutchinson Cheshunt 6 

Josh Bonnett Waltham Forest 6 

  

South 
Jason Prior Bognor Regis Town 14 

Frankie Sawyer Dulwich Hamlet 11 

Shaun Welford Maidstone United 9 

Terry Dodd Bognor Regis Town 8 

Charlie Ide Walton Casuals 7 

Dave Cook Hythe Town 7 

Stuart Vahid Whitstable Town 7 

Roscoe Dsane Merstham 7 

Kane Sargeant Corinthian-Casuals 6 

Aaron Quain Faversham Town 6 
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General Information 
 

Handbook Changes 

    

Hastings UnitedHastings UnitedHastings UnitedHastings United    

Manager - New manager is Sean Ray, mobile 07875 342610. Email 

 seanrazor81@yahoo.co.uk 

Programme Editor’s email should read -  flid10@yahoo.co.uk 

 Maldon & TiptreeMaldon & TiptreeMaldon & TiptreeMaldon & Tiptree    

All program information is to be sent to the following email address: 

buckby1996@hotmail.co.uk 

Whitstable TownWhitstable TownWhitstable TownWhitstable Town    

New Manager – Justin Luchford, mobile 07919 108063 

 

Club News 

LeistonLeistonLeistonLeiston    

Ryman League Leiston FC is offering free admission to all spectators in their all Suffolk 

clash against rivals AFC Sudbury on Tuesday, November 8th.  

Moving ManagersMoving ManagersMoving ManagersMoving Managers    

Great Wakering Rovers and Whitstable Town appoint new managers, while Aveley part 

company with theirs this week. 

Full details on the news above can be found on the Ryman league website – 

www.isthmian.co.uk  

 

October Team Performance AwardsOctober Team Performance AwardsOctober Team Performance AwardsOctober Team Performance Awards    

Premier Division   East Thurrock United 

Division One North   Redbridge 

Division One South   Godalming Town 
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October Manager of the Month AwardsOctober Manager of the Month AwardsOctober Manager of the Month AwardsOctober Manager of the Month Awards    

Premier Division 

Craig Edwards  

Billericay Town 

Division One North 

Steve Witherspoon  

Brentwood Town 

Division OneSouth 

Jay Saunders  

Maidstone United 

  
 

Ryman Youth League Section 

Results 

Monday, 31st October 2011 

Central Division 

Tooting & Mitcham United 2 - 2 Chipstead 56 
Simpson 16, Nkoma 29 Atille 26, Guest 90 

East Division 

Welling United 1 - 0 Tonbridge Angels 25 
Mukoko 75 

West Division 

Staines Town 5 - 4 Harrow Borough 39 
Boyle 23, Hughes 41, 74, Moore 21, 75, 80, Twumasi 90 

Bates 71, Sotonwa 78 

 

Tuesday, 1st November 2011 

South Division 

Hastings United 3 - 2 Horsham 69 
Ellis 24, 30, Parris 33 Comber 85, 88 

Lucas Fettes Youth Cup – First Round 

Woking 3 - 1 Whyteleafe 51 

Brazil 37, 52, 85 Clare 30 

FA Youth Cup - First Round Proper 

Gillingham 0 - 1 Hayes & Yeading United 409 
 Hubbard 30 

Southend United 4 - 0 Corinthian 271 
Hyams 21, Agyakwa 41, 

Payne 45, Nullings 46 
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Wednesday, 2nd November 2011 

Central Division 

Sutton United 5 - 1 Leatherhead 53 
Olufemi 21, Wanyoni 38, 55, 69, Woolston 68 

Taylor 78 

Walton & Hersham 1 - 1 Carshalton Athletic 38 
Inkpen 66 Dore 79 

East Division 

Ashford United 2 - 0 Bromley 44 
Avis 55, 77 

West Division 

Hampton & Richmond Borough 0 - 6 Wingate & Finchley 16 
                                                                            Duncan 12, 49, Ozkumru 20, 60, 

                                                                                     Suddell 25 (pen), Taylor 83 

    Lucas Fettes Youth Cup – First Round 

Wealdstone 0 - 2 Waltham Abbey 45 

 Gilchrist 33, 71 

FA Youth Cup - First Round Proper 

Brentford 3 - 0 Lewes 265 
Dobson 9, Roe 60. 

Hippolyte 85 

Cirencester Town 3 - 1 Camberley Town                                     75 
Shepherd 33, Farr 80, Spurr 70 
Hale 90 

 

Thursday, 3rd November 2011 

East Division 

Thamesmead Town Postponed Maidstone United  
(Waterlogged pitch) 

South Division 

Horsham YMCA 2 - 3 Bognor Regis Town 66 
Love 27, Murrell 66 Lee-Smith 9, McCarthy 29, 87 

West Division 

Northwood 0 - 3 Ashford Town (Middx) 44 
 Sopjani 2, Nurkollari 50, 

 Molyneaux 84 

FA Youth Cup - First Round Proper 
Aldershot Town 3 - 2 Kingstonian 102 

Steer 26, Brice 65, Cheklit 21, 29 

Bowerman 90+3 
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League Tables  
(As at 30

th
 October 2011) 

 

CENTRAL DIVISION P W D L F A Pts GD 

Woking 6 4 2 0 19 5 14 +14  

Sutton United 7 3 2 2 17 14 11 +3  

Kingstonian 3 3 0 0 11 0 9 +11  

Chipstead 6 2 2 2 16 13 8 +3  

Metropolitan Police 7 2 2 3 16 16 8 +0  

Walton & Hersham 8 2 2 4 13 18 8 -5  

Carshalton Athletic 7 2 2 3 11 16 8 -5  

Leatherhead 5 2 0 3 8 14 6 -6  

Tooting & Mitcham United 6 1 3 2 8 17 6 -9  

Whyteleafe 5 1 1 3 7 13 4 -6  

 

EAST DIVISION P W D L F A Pts GD 

 

Maidstone United 8 5 2 1 17 6 17 +11  

Tonbridge Angels 8 3 3 2 14 11 12 +3  

Welling United 6 3 1 2 10 9 10 +1  

Ashford United 6 3 0 3 10 8 9 +2  

Corinthian 4 2 2 0 9 4 8 +5  

Thamesmead Town 7 2 2 3 11 20 8 -9  

Faversham Town 7 1 3 3 10 14 6 -4  

Bromley 6 0 1 5 7 16 1 -9  

 

SOUTH DIVISION P W D L F A Pts GD 

Worthing 5 4 1 0 14 4 13 +10  

Hastings United 6 4 0 2 17 19 12 -2  

Lewes 4 3 0 1 16 8 9 +8  

Whitehawk 5 3 0 2 17 11 9 +6  

Horsham YMCA 6 2 2 2 13 14 8 -1  

Burgess Hill Town 4 2 1 1 15 9 7 +6  

Bognor Regis Town 6 2 0 4 10 15 6 -5  

Horsham 6 1 1 4 7 22 4 -15  

Eastbourne Town 6 0 1 5 10 17 1 -7  

 

WEST DIVISION P W D L F A Pts GD 

Wingate & Finchley 8 5 0 3 20 14 15 +6  

Ashford Town (Middx) 4 4 0 0 13 3 12 +10  

Hayes & Yeading United 4 3 1 0 13 3 10 +10  

Staines Town 3 3 0 0 17 7 9 +10  

Harrow Borough 7 3 0 4 23 19 9 +4  

Wealdstone 4 2 0 2 10 13 6 -3  

Camberley Town 4 1 0 3 4 8 3 -4  

Northwood 7 0 2 5 7 28 2 -21  

        Hampton & Richmond Borough 5 0 1 4 5 17 1 -12 
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Forthcoming Fixtures 

 

Monday, 7th November 2011 

Central Division 

Leatherhead v. Carshalton Athletic 

Metropolitan Police v. Tooting & Mitcham United 

East Division 

Tonbridge Angels v. Bromley 

South Division 

Burgess Hill Town v. Eastbourne Town 

Hastings United v. Horsham YMCA 

Lewes v. Worthing 

Middlesex FA Youth Cup – Second Round 

Staines Town v. Wealdstone  

Tokyington Manor  v. Hampton & Richmond Borough 

 

Tuesday, 8th November 2011 

East Division 

Faversham Town v. Thamesmead Town 

Middlesex FA Youth Cup – Second Round 

Enfield 1893 v. Ashford Town (Middx)  

 

Wednesday, 9th November 2011 

Central Division 

Chipstead v. Woking 

West Division 

Harrow Borough v. Camberley Town 

Lucas Fettes Youth Cup – First Round 

Sutton United v. Kingstonian  

Lucas Fettes Youth Cup – Second Round 

Waltham Abbey v.  Hampton & Richmond Borough 

Thursday, 10th November 2011 

Central Division 

Whyteleafe v. Walton & Hersham 

East Division 

Corinthian v. Ashford United 

Maidstone United v. Welling United 

Middlesex FA Youth Cup – Second Round 

Northwood v. Hillingdon 

 

Monday, 14th November 2011 

Central Division 

Tooting & Mitcham United v. Carshalton Athletic 

East Division 

Welling United v. Corinthian 

South Division 
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Eastbourne Town v. Hastings United 

Lewes v. Burgess Hill Town 

West Division 

Ashford Town (Middx) v. Harrow Borough 

Camberley Town v. Hampton & Richmond Borough 

Staines Town v. Northwood 

FA Youth Cup - Second Round Proper 

Thurrock v. Hayes & Yeading United 

 

Wednesday, 16th November 2011 

East Division 

Ashford United v. Tonbridge Angels 

South Division 

Whitehawk v. Bognor Regis Town 

West Division 

Wealdstone v. Wingate & Finchley 

Surrey FA Youth Cup – Second Round 

Chipstead v. Kingstonian 

Sutton United v. Woking 

Walton & Hersham v. Knaphill 

 

Thursday, 17th November 2011 

Central Division 

Whyteleafe v. Metropolitan Police 

East Division 

Thamesmead Town v. Bromley 

South Division 

Horsham YMCA v. Horsham 

 

Week beginning Monday, 21st November 2011 

Lucas Fettes Youth Cup – Second Round 

Waltham Abbey v. Hampton & Richmond Borough 

Woking v. Horsham YMCA 

 

Monday, 21st November 2011 

Lucas Fettes Youth Cup – Second Round 

Camberley Town v. Hayes & Yeading United 

Carshalton Athletic v. Sutton United or Kingstonian  

Tonbridge Angels v. Corinthian 

Welling United v. Burgess Hill Town 

Worthing v. Horsham 

 

Tuesday, 22nd November 2011 

Lucas Fettes Youth Cup – Second Round 

Folkestone Invicta v. Ashford United 
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Wednesday, 23rd November 2011 

Lucas Fettes Youth Cup – Second Round 

Lewes v. Chipstead 

Margate v. Maidstone United 

Walton & Hersham v. Tooting & Mitcham United 

 

Thursday, 24th November 2011 

Lucas Fettes Youth Cup – Second Round 

Northwood v. Ashford Town (Middx) 

Thamesmead Town v. Billericay Town 

Tilbury v. Brentwood Town 

 

Sunday, 27th November 2011 

Sussex FA Youth Cup – Third Round 

Burgess Hill Town v. Hastings United 

Eastbourne Borough v. Eastbourne Town 

Eastbourne United Association v. Lewes 

 

Facts and Figures 

 

Leading Goal Scorers (as at 6th November  2011) 

Fredrick Taylor Whitehawk  7 

Wanyoni Sutton United  7 

Matthew Daniel Whitehawk  6 

Andreas Kyprianou Wingate & Finchley  6 

Bayan Fenwick Lewes  6 

Charlie Smith Maidstone United  6 

Aaron Parris Hastings United  6 

 

Hat-trick Heroes 

 

George Moore Harrow Borough 

Dean Brazil Woking 

Daniel Wanyoni Sutton United 
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66CP  Div    Played 
Yellow 

(5) 
Red (10) Misconduct (10) 

Technical 
Area 

TOTAL  

1 P 1 Harrow Borough 14         0 

2 S 1 Dulwich Hamlet 12         0 

3 N 1 Ilford 13       1 1 

4 S 2 Burgess Hill Town 12       1 1 

5 P 2 Horsham 13       2 2 

6 N 2 Harlow Town 13       3 3 

7 S 3 Chipstead 11       4 4 

8 P 3 Margate 12       5 5 

9 N 3 Great Wakering Rovers 14 1     1 6 

10 N 4 Ware 13 1     1 6 

11 S 4 Crawley Down 13 1     1 6 

12 N 5 Heybridge Swifts 13       6 6 

13 N 6 Waltham Abbey 12 1     1 6 

14 N 7 Thamesmead Town 11 1     1 6 

15 P 4 Tooting & Mitcham 14 1     2 7 

16 S 5 Folkestone Inv 13       7 7 

17 P 5 Hendon 12       7 7 

18 N 8 Redbridge 11 1     2 7 

19 N 9 Brentwood Town 13 1     4 9 

20 N 10 Soham Town Rangers 14 2     2 12 

21 P 6 AFC Hornchurch 14 2     2 12 

22 P 7 Kingstonian 14 2     2 12 

23 N 11 AFC Sudbury 10 2     2 12 

24 P 8 Billericay Town 13 2     3 13 

25 N 12 Needham Market 12 2     3 13 

26 S 6 Whyteleafe 12 2     4 14 

27 S 7  Merstham 11 2     4 14 

28 S 8 Eastbourne Town 13 1     10 15 

29 N 13 Cheshunt 13 3     1 16 

30 P 9 East Thurrock United 11 3     1 16 

31 S 9 Ramsgate 13 1   1 2 17 

32 N 14 Enfield Town 13 2     7 17 

33 N 15 Maldon & Tiptree 10 3     2 17 

34 S 10 Worthing 9 2     7 17 

35 S 11 Walton & Hersham 13 3     3 18 

36 N 16 Leiston 13     1 8 18 

37 N 17 Potters Bar 13 3     4 19 

38 S 12 Maidstone United 12 3     4 19 

39 P 10 Hasting United 14 3     5 20 

40 P 11 Wealdstone 14 4     0 20 

41 S 13 Croydon Ath 12 2   1 0 20 

42 S 14 Bognor Regis Town 12 4     0 20 

43 S 15 Faversham Town 11 2 1   0 20 
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44 P 12 Metropolitan Police 14 4     1 21 

45 S 16 Walton Casuals 13 2     11 21 

46 P 13 Wingate & Finchley 13 4     1 21 

47 P 14 Lewes 13 2     12 22 

48 N 18 Grays Athletic 13 3     8 23 

49 P 15 Carshalton Ath 13 5     1 26 

50 S 17 Godalming Town 10 5     1 26 

51 S 18 Whitehawk 11 2   1 8 28 

52 P 16 Bury Town 13 5     4 29 

53 S 19 Whitstable Town 13 4 1   0 30 

54 P 17 Lowestoft Town 12 1 1   15 30 

55 P 18 Canvey Island 13 1 1 1 6 31 

56 P 19 Concord Rangers 13 5     7 32 

57 P 20 Leatherhead 11 4   1 2 32 

58 P 21 Aveley 14 2   2 4 34 

59 N 19 Waltham Forest 10 5   1 1 36 

60 S 20 Sittingbourne 11 7     3 38 

61 N 20 Tilbury 14 3 1 1 5 40 

62 P 22 Cray Wanderers 12 4   2 1 41 

63 N 21 Romford 14 6     13 43 

64 N 22 Chatham Town 14 5   1 13 48 

65 S 21 Hythe Town 13 5   1 14 49 

66 S 22 Corinthian -Casuals 12 4 1 2 1 51 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Visit the Ryman League Website for more up to date news as it arrives at: 

www.isthmian.co.uk 

Our next bulletin will be published on 

Monday 14
th

 November 2011 

Midweek round up will be published on Thursday 10
th

 November 2011 

Please send any news items for the Website to the League’s Communications Administrator 

Peter Butcher (peter@isthmian.co.uk) 

 

File downloaded from: http://www.thedarts.eu/bulletins/ryman.htm 
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